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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: S.GANESH RAM <sgram2002@gmail.com> 
Date: Sat 4 Aug, 2018, 8:10 AM 
Subject: Subscription of St John's Chapter (R A)No.2 
To: Prashant kripa Elangovan <delta-flight@hotmail.com> 
Cc: manikandan parthasarathy <manisarathi@yahoo.com> 
 
 
Dear Companion,
 
I had in the past sent you many a reminders to pay your subscription of Rs.665.00.I have neither rece
Manikandan were also  in vain.Please note that carrying forward of subscription arrears is not allowed
ending if your subscription remains unpaid we will be compelled to remove you from our rolls.
 
This is the last and final reminder from the Chapter which you may kindly take note of.
 
Best wishes
 
S.GANESH RAM
TREASURER
ST JOHNS' CHAPTER (R A) No 2
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