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Fwd: ALBERT/LODGEEAGLE/SUBSCRIPTIONAMOUNT TRANSFERRED TO BANK ACCOUNT

From: Albert Rego (albertrego@gmail.com)
To:  gb_sethi@yahoo.co.in
Date: Thursday, 18 April, 2019, 4:57 pm IST

Dear Bro. G. B Sethi,
Good Evening Brother G. B. Sefhi. Piease find below email received regarding dues.
Thanking You,
Your's Fraternally
Bro. Albert

Forwarded message
From: Sharath Choudary <sharath_choudary@hotmail.com>

Date: Thu, Apr 18, 2019 at 12:23 PM

Subject: Re: ALBERT/LODGEEAGLE/SUBSCRIPTIONAMOUNT TRANSFERRED TO BANK ACCOUNT

To: Albert Rego <albertrego@gmail.com>

Cc: Sharath (yahoo) <sharath_choudary@yahoo.com>, Sharath Choudary <sharath.choudary@gmail.com>, vp.sify@gmail.com <vp.sify@gmail.com>, Narayan Prasad
Malladi <daryus64@yahoo.com>

Dear Bro Albert,
The amount of Rs 4000/- sent by you exceeds current dues of Rs 2600/~ per annum.
Consequently, you have no dues and infact have a credit balance with the Lodge.

Yours Fraternally, ,ﬁ B Zl—
Sharath Choud s
Seill::tary L?):g:r)éagle No 334. % /Z)Z[ 28 & 4 ﬁ cate

He Profits Most Who Serves Best

Sent from my iPhone %',

On 18-Apr-2019, at 12:02, Albert Rego <albertrego@gmail.com> wrote:
Bro. Jlherd- Peso
Dear Bro.Sharath,

Have transferred an amount of Rs 4000 to the Lodge Eagle bank account as i did not know what is the exact amount due .Please inform if it has
fallen short to enable me to transfer the shortfall and if in excess it can be carried forward to the next year's account.

DETAILS
Txn Date  Value Date Description
i5-Apr-19  15-Apr-19 TO TRANSFER-INB NEFT UTR NO: SBIN319105795665--LODGE EAGLE NO 334
Ref No. Debit
NEFT INB: 1RJ1073299 / LODGE EAGLE NO 334 4,000.00

Please send me a no due certificate , even an email would suffice ,
if there is no amount due.

Thanking You,
Your's Fraternally
Bro. Albert



